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Abstract

Societies emerging from internal armed conflicts display surprising variation in the degree to which

governments protect human rights. Employing new data on civilian victimization by both government

and rebel forces, we find that the human rights climate of a post-conflict country is not simply a per-

petuation of pre-conflict conditions, or the result of repressive regimes remaining in power. Instead,

the treatment of civilians during conflict has an independent impact on post-conflict human rights pro-

tections (HRP). Analyses of ninety-six post-conflict periods (1960–2015) show that when governments

systematically and extensively target civilians during counterinsurgency campaigns, post-conflict hu-

man rights conditions decline substantially compared to pre-conflict levels, even accounting for other

predictors of human rights violations, including pre-conflict human rights conditions. This holds re-

gardless of who is in power after conflicts end. These findings have implications for theoreticalmodels

of repression and conflict cycles, and for practitioners and policymakers aiming to restore and protect

human rights after war.
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Following civil war termination, some governments take
significant steps to improve human rights protections
(HRP) for their citizens. In other cases, even the over-
throw of a brutal regime and its replacement with a party
expected to advance human rights leads to continued
abuses. Figure 1 shows that while pre- and post-conflict
human rights conditions are similar in many countries,
others experience dramatically improved or drastically
worse human rights conditions. How can we explain this
disparity in post-conflict trajectories?

Note: Research for some of the data used in this article was
funded by a grant from the Office of Naval Research, US
Department of the Navy, No. N00014-09-1-0557, to Patricia L.
Sullivan andMiaM. Bloom, principal investigators. All coding
decisions and results are those of the authors and do not nec-
essarily reflect the views of the Office of Naval Research.

Multiple existing studies help us understand how state
repression affects the onset and severity of civil war, and
some related work indicates how repression by non-state
actors can do the same. Relatedly, the literature offers
some insights into how repression shapes how civil wars
end. Less systematic information exists about how or
why repression changes after wars end.1 Advancing this
important line of inquiry, we conduct a systematic com-
parative analysis of the determinants of human rights
practices in post-conflict countries. Human rights vio-
lations are objectionable in their own right, but poor
protection for human rights also appears to perpetuate
“conflict traps” by depressing economic development
and generating grievances that increase the odds of

1 We thank an anonymous reviewer for suggesting this
language.
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2 How Human Rights Protections Change After Internal Armed Conflicts

Figure 1. Changes in HRP scores from the five years prior to conflict onset to the decade after conflict termination, in close to 100

countries in which there was an internal armed conflict between 1960 and 2015 and for which data on HRP are available

Source: Fariss (2014); authors’ calculations.

Note: Years denote the time of conflict termination. Observations below the horizontal line at 0 are conflicts where HRP worsened
after the end of the conflict. Observations above the line are conflicts where HRP improved after conflict ended.

conflict recurrence (Collier et al. 2003; Walter 2015). Ac-
knowledging prior work on variance in social, economic,
and political conditions in post-conflict countries,2 we
focus on repression as a consequential dimension of post-
conflict governance.

Building on the literatures on the causes of repression
and work on civilian victimization during internal armed
conflicts, we explore how the targeting of civilians by
government and rebel forces during a war might impact
both motivation and opportunity to intensify or reduce
repression in the postwar environment. Just as internal
armed conflict does lasting damage to a country’s econ-
omy,3 it can—but need not—worsen human rights con-
ditions in the long run. To explain when this happens, we
argue that warfighting strategies that deliberately target
civilians hinder the ability of post-conflict countries

2 Examples of this literature include Ghobarah, Huth, and
Russett (2003), Kang and Meernik (2005), Lai and Thyne
(2007), Hoddie and Smith (2009), Jarstad (2009), Iqbal
(2010), Meernik, Nichols, and King (2010), and Huang
(2016).

3 See Tir and Karreth (2018, chs. 1 and 2) for a summary of
research on this point.

to return to the level of HRP that existed prior to the war.
We define civilian targeting by governments or rebels dur-
ing armed conflict as the consistent selection of civilians
as direct objects of attack or consistent failure to discrim-
inate between combatants and noncombatants in mili-
tary operations throughout the course of a conflict. These
strategies harden social divisions, intensify the domes-
tic security dilemma in post-conflict countries, and dis-
courage post-conflict governments from creating effec-
tive, impartial rule of law. Extensive targeting of civilians
affects a postwar government’s incentives to violate the
human rights of its citizens and the strength of domestic
institutions that could constrain leaders from engaging in
repression.

Employing new data on civilian targeting by both
government and rebel forces, we show that the human
rights climate of a post-conflict country is not simply a
perpetuation of pre-conflict conditions, or the result of
repressive regimes remaining in power following war
termination. We provide a possible explanation for some
puzzling results in the post-conflict literature. Recent
studies have failed to show a consistent relationship
between civil war outcomes and democratization. Some
scholars find that military victory by the civil war
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government increases the likelihood of post-conflict
democratization (Joshi and Mason 2011, 402), while
other studies argue that only rebel victory increases
prospects for democratization (Wantchekon 2004; Toft
2010). Several find evidence that negotiated settlements
are most conducive to the development of democratic in-
stitutions in the post-conflict period (Gurses and Mason
2008; Nilsson 2012; Hartzell and Hoddie 2015; Huang
2016). A few studies conclude that there is no relation-
ship between civil war outcomes and democratization
(Joshi 2010; Fortna and Huang 2012). Could it be that
even after long, costly conflicts in which many lives are
lost, it makes no difference which side governs? One of
the key insights from our study is that the relationship
between war outcomes and human rights practices is
conditioned by the government’s treatment of civilians
during the war. Importantly, the effect of wartime
civilian targeting is not just a manifestation of brutal
civil war governments that remain in power following
conflict termination. While pre-conflict human rights
conditions are a strong determinant of human rights
conditions after a conflict ends, wartime brutality exerts
an independent effect on the human rights practices of
post-conflict regimes, regardless of whether those who
directed the targeting of civilians stay in power or are
replaced by their opponents. In sum, this study proposes
that changes in HRP after a civil war are best explained
by disaggregating three dimensions: whether combatants
targeted civilians during the conflict, who those actors
were, and who assumed power after the conflict.

State Repression in Post-Conflict

Countries: Motivation and Opportunity

Countries experiencing ongoing armed conflict have
significantly higher rates of human rights violations than
countries at peace (Mitchell and McCormick 1988; Poe
and Tate 1994). However, even after a civil war has
formally ended, post-conflict societies are characterized
by multiple factors researchers have linked to state
repression. Although the government may no longer be
engaged in open combat against opponents, post-conflict
instability and latent violent threats may motivate hu-
man rights abuses by government actors. A substantial
literature concludes that domestic instability and, more
specifically, threats to their hold on power, motivate
regimes to employ repressive tactics (Poe and Tate 1994;
Davenport 1995; Gartner and Regan 1996; Regan and
Henderson 2002). In the immediate post-conflict period,
the risk of return to civil war is high and the distribution
of power is still in flux. As a country transitions from
active conflict to peace, armed groups often continue to

target each other and both government and opposition
factionsmay attack civilian supporters of the other side in
a bid for power and influence (Kathman andWood 2016,
151–3). It can take some time for belligerents who have
officially surrendered or agreed to a negotiated settle-
ment to disarm and demobilize, so low-level violence
typically persists even after an internal armed conflict
has officially ended in a military victory or negotiated
settlement (Cunningham, Gleditsch, and Salehyan 2009;
Boyle 2014).

At the same time, the fragility or absence of domestic
political institutions that typically constrain leaders from
engaging in human rights violations provides a permis-
sive environment for such abuses. A robust body of re-
search has demonstrated that political institutions, such
as independent court systems and separation of pow-
ers, can deter leaders from violently suppressing dis-
sent and increase HRP (e.g., Keith 2002; Davenport and
Armstrong 2004; Davenport 2007; Powell and Staton
2009; Hafner-Burton, Hyde, and Jablonski 2014). But
civil wars severely weaken domestic political and institu-
tional processes (Joshi 2010; Gates et al. 2012). The in-
formal institutions that can constrain state repression—
social norms and expectations about human rights and
civilian protection—are also eroded during significant pe-
riods of violence. Mass public opinion surveys and in-
depth studies have found that exposure to violence re-
duces individuals’ tolerance for out-groups and increases
the appeal of violence and aggression to pursue goals (for
an overview, see Blattman, Hartman, and Blair 2014).

It is therefore unsurprising that human rights condi-
tions are generally poor in post-conflict societies. But re-
search to date does not directly address why some post-
conflict societies manifest more severe rights violations
after conflicts end, while others move toward greater
HRP. In the next section, we link existing work on state
repression to more recent research on civilian victimiza-
tion to theorize about the postwar legacy of belligerents’
treatment of civilians during internal armed conflicts.

Civilian Targeting and Variation in Human

Rights Conditions across Post-Conflict

Countries

Consistent with the extensive literature on state repres-
sion, we assume that governing regimes use repressive
tactics primarily in order to maintain control over the
population and retain office (Gurr 1986; Davenport
1995; Gartner and Regan 1996; Regan and Henderson
2002). Human rights abuses like torture, disappearances,
and extrajudicial killings can deter citizens from chal-
lenging leaders and decrease the ability of dissenters to
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4 How Human Rights Protections Change After Internal Armed Conflicts

mobilize (Moore 2000; Davenport 2000, 2007). Govern-
ments are most likely to engage in human rights viola-
tions when: (1) they perceive a need to suppress or elimi-
nate political rivals in order to consolidate their hold on
power; and (2) both formal institutional and informal
normative constraints on the abuse of civilians are weak
(Poe and Tate 1994; Davenport and Armstrong 2004;
Carey 2010; Bell and Murdie 2018).

We argue that civilian targeting during an armed con-
flict has enduring impacts on the severity of regime vul-
nerability to domestic threats and the strength of both
formal and informal institutional constraints on govern-
ment repression in post-conflict countries. Warfighting
strategies that deliberately target civilians produce vul-
nerable postwar governments because they intensify the
domestic security dilemma that exists after most internal
armed conflicts. Armed groups on the losing side of a civil
war are often reluctant to disarm and demobilize after
conflict termination for fear that the postwar government
will take advantage of their vulnerability (Walter 1997,
2002). This fear is likely to be especially intense when
civilians as well as combatants were targeted in the fight-
ing. After a brutal war with widespread civilian targeting,
the post-conflict government will have difficulty credibly
committing to protect marginalized populations or to re-
spect the rights of former combatants and civilians seen
as supporting the side that lost the war. Civilian target-
ing also creates especially deep and enduring grievances
and polarizes group identities (Balcells 2010, 2017; Boyle
2014). The persistence of grievances and hardening of
social identities can fuel mutual suspicion and violent
reprisals, leaving populations feeling especially vulnera-
ble. Populations seen as sympathetic to the side that lost
the war will fear becoming targets of former combatants
that remain armed, or of the postwar regime itself. In a
security dilemma, perceived insecurity motivates civilians
to arm themselves and leads armed non-state actors to
resist post-conflict disarmament and demobilization ini-
tiatives. For its part, the government is likely to see re-
sistance to disarmament as a threat to regime survival,
even if the underlying motivation is defensive. When the
government reacts to this perceived threat by harshly re-
pressing dissent, it reinforces the cycle of fear, violence,
and repression (Posen 1993; Kaufmann 1996; Poe 2004;
Carey 2010).

The aftermath of armed conflict between the Ba’athist
government of Iraq and Kurdish opposition groups in
Northern Iraq during the 1980s illustrates how civilian
targeting during an armed conflict can contribute to a
self-perpetuating cycle of grievance, mutual vulnerabil-
ity, violence, and repression. During the war, the Iraqi
government of Saddam Hussein purposefully targeted

and killed civilians on a massive scale. Daily air and ar-
tillery attacks targeted heavily populated agricultural ar-
eas. The government’s military operations in 1988 killed
approximately 100,000 Kurdish civilians (Hardi 2011,
13). In March of 1988 alone, roughly 5,000 civilians
were reported killed during the government’s chemical
attack on the city of Halabja (Kelly 2008, 33; Renahan
2017).

After the war, human rights conditions in Iraq fur-
ther deteriorated as the government tightened its re-
pressive grip over the population (Human Rights Watch
1995; United States Department of State 1995, 1997).
Figure 2 illustrates this development. The brutality of the
war and, in particular, the government’s chemical strikes
on Halabja, generated and hardened Kurdish grievances
against the Iraqi government and contributed to eth-
nic animosities (Anderson 2016). Armed Kurdish oppo-
sition groups remained active, retaining control of the
Kurdistan region (Simons 1994, 28). The United Orga-
nization of the Halabja Martyrs—an extremist Kurdish
organization—vowed vengeance against the Iraqi gov-
ernment and carried out terrorist attacks (Stern 2000).
The government restricted the supply of food, medicine,
and electricity to the northern areas populated by Kurds
(United States Department of State 1995); burned Kur-
dish villages (Human Rights Watch 1993); and force-
fully replaced Kurdish civilians with Arab civilians in the
northeast (Human Rights Watch 1991, 1993). The gov-
ernment also compelled non-Arabs to label themselves
as Arabs (Human Rights Watch 2004). Even pledges by
the government to protect the rights of political oppo-
nents of the regime and their supporters were generally
not credible. The government issued amnesties4 for Iraqi
Kurds and other opponents of the government, but the
amnesties were often not honored (Human Rights Watch
1992; Rohde 2010, 38). Many Kurds that did return to
Iraq under the amnesty protections were stripped of their
economic and political rights and remained at consider-
able risk for persecution and execution by the govern-
ment (Human Rights Watch 1993). Some Kurds return-
ing to Iraq under the 1991 amnesty decrees were arrested
and executed (Human Rights Watch 1992). The United
Nations’ special rapporteur concluded that the amnesties
were simply a ruse to cover up the government’s real

4 The government issued a general amnesty to all Iraqi
Kurds on September 8, 1988 following the end of thewar
(Rohde 2010, 38). Another general amnesty for all Iraqi
Kurds was issued in April 1990 and subsequently ex-
tended until July of that year (Minorities at Risk Project
2004).
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Figure 2. HRP scores in Iraq before, during, and after conflict. Higher scores indicate better human rights protection.

Source: Fariss (2014); authors’ calculations.

Notes: During the conflict, the government engaged in systematic targeting of civilians (conflict ID in the STAC data: 6451980). The

gray area highlights the conflict period. Mean latent HRP scores are shown by the black lines, with a confidence interval (± one

standard deviation) in dashed lines.

intention of rooting out members of opposition organi-
zations (Human Rights Watch 1992).

Following from the logic of the domestic security
dilemma, and generalizing the dynamics observed in Iraq,
our first hypothesis suggests an increase in repression in
countries emerging from civil wars during which combat-
ants systematically targeted civilians. Countries in which
civilian targeting occurs during conflict will typically be
characterized by poor human rights environments even
before the armed conflict begins. But we expect that in
two cases with comparably bad HRP before a conflict,
the country with civilian targeting will see an even worse
deterioration of HRP after the conflict ends.

H1: Holding pre-conflict human rights conditions con-
stant, extensive targeting of civilians during the war is
associated with a further decline in the government’s
efforts to protect human rights after the conflict.

Hypothesis 1 does not address who targeted civilians,
but our study design allows us to distinguish between the
perpetrators of civilian targeting. We therefore explore
two versions of Hypothesis 1: a general and an actor-
specific version, as illustrated in Table 1. In the actor-
specific form of Hypothesis 1—part (b) of Table 1—we
posit that who targeted civilians may affect the security

dilemma after the conflict and therefore shape the change
in HRP after conflict. It is possible that governments tar-
geting civilians is particularly harmful for post-conflict
incentives to repress. Governments possess the monopoly
on violence, which implies a special responsibility. Gov-
ernments are also beholden to international law on the
treatment of civilians (specifically Article 13 in Protocol
II of the Geneva Conventions). Violating the legal and
norms-based prohibition of targeting civilians can erode
domestic norms further and lessen constraints on post-
conflict governments’ use of repressive tools. When gov-
ernments are not alone in targeting civilians, it is possible
that their targeting can be framed as a response to par-
ticularly ruthless rebels, lessening the impact of targeting
on post-conflict norms against human rights violations.
In sum, the special status of governments from a norma-
tive and legal perspective may make governments’ use of
civilian targeting particularly detrimental for HRP after
conflict.

While Hypothesis 1 anticipates that brutal civil wars
engender post-conflict societies with poor human rights
conditions regardless of who rules after the war, the
extent to which intra-war atrocities lead to postwar
repression may vary by perpetrator and government
composition (cf. the three rows in Table 1). One intuitive
possibility is that human rights conditions will be worst
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6 How Human Rights Protections Change After Internal Armed Conflicts

Table 1. Illustration of Hypothesis 1

when brutal civil war governments remain in power af-
ter war termination. Civilian targeting by an incumbent
regime during a counterinsurgency campaign indicates
that institutions like the legislature and the judiciary that
might otherwise constrain the executive and hold indi-
viduals accountable for violating citizens’ basic rights are
weak or nonexistent. Toft (2010, 25) maintains that in-
cumbent governments that prevail over an armed oppo-
sition are more likely than rebel-led governments to take
their victory as an opportunity to repress supporters of
the rebellion after war termination.

Moreover, culpability for war crimes discourages the
creation of formal institutions that could constrain the
behavior of the postwar government, creating a permis-
sive environment for human rights abuses.When postwar
leaders are guilty of targeting civilians during an armed
conflict, they should be reluctant to create or strengthen
institutions that would hold members of the former
regime accountable for atrocities—an independent judi-
ciary, human rights offices, and truth commissions, for
example. If these institutions were effective, former vic-
tims or current dissidents could use them to take retroac-
tive action against culpable political leaders. Because in-
stitutions of accountability for human rights violations
are also the institutions that could effectively constrain
future human rights violations (Kim and Sikkink 2010),
culpable regimes should remain relatively unconstrained.
Incumbents who prevail by pursuing brutal counterinsur-
gency campaigns may tighten their grip on domestic in-
stitutions that could constrain their behavior—exerting
greater executive control over the judiciary, mass me-
dia, and civil society organizations that could serve as

platforms for dissidents to denounce the government’s
human rights violations during the war.

Postwar Guatemala provides an example of this
dynamic. During a war that lasted for thirty-six years,
successive military governments in Guatemala pursued a
scorched-earth strategy against leftist rebel groups repre-
senting the majority indigenous Maya and poor Ladino
peasant populations in rural Guatemala (Höglund 2004;
Spence 2005). In its 1999 report, the Commission
for Historical Clarification5 concludes that government
armed forces committed more than 90 percent of all hu-
man rights violations during the course of the war, includ-
ing 626 massacres against Mayan communities, in what
amounted to genocide against the Maya (UN Historical
Clarification Commission 1999, 34). Jonas (2000, 24) es-
timates that between 1981 and 1983, one of the most
brutal periods of the war, approximately 150,000 civil-
ians were killed and “440 villages were entirely wiped off
the face of the map” by government forces.

The civil war terminated in a comprehensive peace
agreement—the 1996 Peace Accords6—and the post-
war government pledged its commitment to human
rights by signing up to several human rights treaties
(Human Rights Watch 1997; Höglund 2004). However,
postwar governments under the leaderships of civilian-
elected presidents Álvaro Arzú (1996–2000) and Alfonso

5 UN Historical Clarification Commission (CEH).
Guatemala: Memory of Silence, February 25, 1999.

6 Agreement of a Firm Lasting Peace (December 29,
2016). For details, see https://peaceaccords.nd.edu/
accord/accord-firm-and-lasting-peace.
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JOHANNES KARRETH, PATRICIA LYNNE SULLIVAN, AND GHAZAL DEZFULI 7

Portillo (2000–2004) were unwilling to follow through
on many critical reforms despite donors having provided
millions of dollars of aid aimed at strengthening the jus-
tice, legal, and police sectors (Ruhl 2005; Stanley 2007,
136; International Crisis Group 2012). Under both ad-
ministrations, crackdowns against suspected critics of the
government were widespread. The United Nations Veri-
ficationMission in Guatemala (MINGUA) reported hun-
dreds of human rights abuses, but the government failed
to launch investigations into them (Human Rights Watch
2002). Government authorities, particularly members of
the military, frequently harassed and intimidated judges,
lawyers, prosecutors, journalists, and witnesses (Amnesty
International 1999; Human Rights Watch 2002; Ruhl
2005). The National Civilian Police often encouraged or
directly engaged in human rights abuses (Human Rights
Watch 2002). Instead of curbing the influence of the mil-
itary, the government augmented its powers substantially
by increasing its financial resources and the scope of its
activities (Ruhl 2005). Generalizing this experience, we
anticipate higher levels of repression when governments
culpable of wartime atrocities remain in power after con-
flict termination.

H2: Post-conflict human rights conditions will remain
poor, or be further degraded from pre-conflict levels,
when a government that engaged in widespread target-
ing of civilians during the war remains in power after war
termination.

A government’s targeting of civilians during war
could impact postwar repression even if the regime is re-
moved from power. Government brutality can radical-
ize the opposition and weaken institutional constraints
on rebel-led governments. Tactics that deliberately or in-
discriminately target civilians generate high levels of re-
sentment and alienate swaths of the population. Violence
perpetrated against civilians by an incumbent govern-
ment may also produce a more extremist opposition by:
(1) attracting recruits motivated by a desire to seek re-
venge for their own treatment or those of loved ones;
and (2) increasing popular support for rebel leaders and
armed groups that adopt more hardline positions against
the government and its supporters (Lichbach 1987). As
Daxecker (2017, 1263) notes, “heavy-handed coercion
alienates members of marginalized groups from the gov-
ernment, victimizes innocents and drives them to terror-
ist groups, and radicalizes people already sympathetic
to the goals of the group.”7 Several recent studies have

7 See also Gartner and Regan (1996), Kydd and Walter
(2006), Bueno de Mesquita and Dickson (2007), and
Piazza (2017).

found that direct exposure to violence reduces an individ-
ual’s tolerance for out-groups and increases support for
the use of violent tactics (for an overview, see Blattman,
Hartman, and Blair 2014). As more moderate leaders
and groups lose both fighters and supporters to more
radical movements, the opposition as a whole shifts to-
ward greater extremism. Should the opposition prevail
and seize control of the government, the leaders they put
in place are unlikely to protect the rights of every citi-
zen. The leadership of the newly formed government may
have grievances of their own to avenge and will have an
aggrieved constituency eager for retribution against sup-
porters of the brutal civil war government.

Postwar Uganda illustrates this. The National Re-
sistance Army (NRA), led by Yoweni Museveni, de-
feated the government’s United National Liberation
Army (UNLA) after five years of war beginning in 1981
(Bell 2016). The UNLA, composed mainly of members
of the Langi and Acholi ethnic groups, committed the
bulk of human rights violations during the war.8 Un-
der the Presidency of Obote, the UNLA committed mas-
sacres and terrorized civilians, driving scores of civil-
ians to support the NRA during the war (Dodge and
Raundalen 1991, 51–2; Bell 2016). Civilians, includ-
ing those belonging to the Baganda ethnic group, were
conspicuously murdered, raped, and tortured (Klugman,
Neyapti, and Stewart 1999, 25; Toft 2009, 103; Bell
2016). In describing the brutality of the government dur-
ing the war, Busuttil and colleagues (1991) conclude
that Obote’s rule “was characterized by military excesses
against civilians which are believed to have exceeded the
brutality of the Amin era.” Estimates suggest that thou-
sands were killed in military campaigns against the NRA
(Bell 2016, 500).

Following the rebel victory in 1986, acts of vio-
lent retaliation by NRA soldiers against ethnic groups
of the UNLA were widespread (Behrend 2000; Bøås
2015; Lamwaka 2016). The NRA killed and tortured
UNLA soldiers, including Acholi soldiers (Behrend 2000;
Lamwaka 2016, 51). The Museveni-led government also
vigorously pursued, arrested, and punished members
of opposition parties, former regime sympathizers, and
even the family members of political leaders affiliated
with prior governments (Amnesty International 1987).
A number of armed opposition groups associated with
former presidents (including Milton Obote) continued
to actively fight the government in the postwar period

8 During the civil war, the government under Obote killed
thousands of people in the Luwero Triangle during coun-
terinsurgency operations and committed serious human
rights violations (Bell 2016).
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8 How Human Rights Protections Change After Internal Armed Conflicts

(Amnesty International 1988). The government cracked
down on these armed movements with aggressive screen-
ing campaigns aimed at vetting communities for par-
ticipation in opposition activity (Amnesty International
2011; Branch 2011, 64). The armed forces were reported
to have killed unarmed civilians during these campaigns,
including hundreds in the Tororo and Gulu districts
(Ofcansky 1999, 66–7). Thousands of others were ar-
rested and jailed. Many suffered from abuse and tor-
ture while in government custody (Amnesty International
2011). In recounting the human rights violations by
the NRA after the war, Lamwaka (2016, 50–1) writes:
“Acholi villagers had never experienced such abuses be-
fore, even during the time of Amin…It then became im-
printed in the minds of the Acholi villagers that the NRA
soldiers were taking revenge on the people for what had
gone wrong in Luwero triangle.”

In contrast to Hypothesis 2, which expects post-
conflict repression to be worst when governments cul-
pable of wartime atrocities remain in power after con-
flict termination,Hypothesis 3 predicts that human rights
abuses will be particularly widespread when brutal civil
war governments are overthrown by the rebels. Like the
NRA in Uganda, opposition movements that experience
civilian targeting by the civil war government will want
to punish the abuses of the former regime on their own
terms—without creating impartial judicial or legal insti-
tutions that could constrain their ability to treat former
regime members and supporters as they see fit.

H3: Post-conflict human rights conditions will remain
poor, or be further degraded from pre-conflict levels,
when a rebel-led government seizes power from a regime
that engaged in extensive targeting of civilians during the
war.

Targeting Civilians during War

Focusing on the long-term consequences of civilian
targeting during civil wars raises the question why
governments engage in this practice in the first place.
The literature suggests two main arguments. First, civil-
ian targeting can be a strategic choice by governments
responding to varying constraints from domestic and
international audiences (Stanton 2016). Democratic in-
stitutions are a key constraint in this regard; democra-
cies see less civilian targeting by governments (Eck and
Hultman 2007). Second, Kalyvas (2006) argues that in-
discriminate violence, i.e., civilian targeting, is most likely
in conflicts with a high imbalance of power between con-
flict actors during the conflict or in low-information envi-
ronments. For our study, this implies that the two broad

country-specific attributes (democratic institutions and
low-information environments) should be accounted for
as well; we address this in the research design immedi-
ately below.

Research Design

We analyze human rights conditions after conflicts in
each year over a period of up to ten years. To identify
conflicts, we use a new dataset, Strategies and Tactics
in Armed Conflict (STAC), which captures all cases of
violent conflict between an incumbent government and
an armed opposition movement within a state between
1945 and 2013 (Sullivan and Karreth 2019b).9 Our unit
of analysis is the post-conflict year. We create annual ob-
servations for a period of ten years after conflict termina-
tion for each country that experienced an internal armed
conflict. Accounting for a lack of information on some
cases and covariates, our analyses cover ninety-six differ-
ent post-conflict periods between 1960 and 2015.10

Outcome Variable

We measure post-conflict HRP using the latent measure
created by Fariss (2014). A challenge to inferring a causal
relationship between civilian victimization and the level
of post-conflict HRP is the high likelihood that civilian
victimization is endogenous; combatants are more likely
to target civilians in countries that have poor HRP. We
address this issue with two strategies.

First, we estimate regressions in which the outcome
is the change in HRP from the pre-conflict average to
the post-conflict year (cf. Figure 1), while including a
lagged measure of pre-conflict conditions—the average
HRP score in a country in the five years prior to conflict
onset.This approach allows us to control for all of the ob-
servable and unobservable country-level factors respon-
sible for variation in countries’ human rights conditions

9 The full dataset, codebook, and coding sources are
available in Sullivan andKarreth (2019b). Variables in the
dataset were coded by a team of research assistants
using over 300 primary and secondary sources.Work on
the dataset began with a grant from the Office of Naval
Research, US Department of the Navy, and continued
with funding from theCarnegie Corporation ofNewYork.
The dataset is documented inmore detail in Sullivan and
Karreth (2019a).

10 Note that the STAC data cover conflict characteristics.
Even though the last conflict coded by STAC ended in
2013, we are able to analyze one post-conflict year be-
yond 2013 because our analyses focus on HRP after
conflicts ended.
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at the start of a conflict as well as those factors whose
initial values predict civilian victimization in a conflict.
We can therefore be more confident about inferring a
causal impact on changes in HRP after conflicts from any
substantive effects associated with explanatory variables
in our empirical model.

Second, we build on the aforementioned literature on
civilian targeting and control for the two most promi-
nent predictors of civilian targeting that might also have
downstream effects on human rights conditions: demo-
cratic institutions before the conflict starts, measuring
constraints. More democratic governments are also less
likely to deliberately target civilians in internal armed
conflicts (Davenport and Armstrong 2004; Valentino,
Huth, and Balch-Lindsay 2004; Valentino 2004). We
measure democracy using the binary indicator from
Cheibub, Gandhi, and Vreeland (2010) in the year be-
fore the conflict starts to avoid any temporal overlap with
intra-war processes. Second, we use population size as a
proxy for low-information environments, assuming that
larger populations generate at least logistical challenges
for governments to gather information on rebel groups
and their support structures. For population, we use the
natural log of the population measure from Gleditsch
(2002).

Method of Analysis

The outcome variable is continuous and approximates
a normal distribution. We fit linear multilevel regression
models with varying intercepts for each conflict. Because
some countries experience multiple conflicts, and we ob-
serve multiple post-conflict years for the same country,
we report country-clustered standard errors for all
analyses below.

Key Explanatory Variables

To test our hypotheses, we build on two variables—
government civilian targeting and rebel civilian
targeting—from the STAC dataset. These variables
indicate whether each actor purposively and repeatedly
targeted civilians during the conflict or not.11 Govern-
ment or rebel forces are considered to have deliberately
engaged in civilian targeting during the armed conflict if
they intentionally selected civilians as direct objects of at-

11 Coding for the civilian targeting variables in STAC builds
on, extends, and cross-validates data on one-sided vi-
olence from the Uppsala Conflict Data Program (UCDP;
Eck and Hultman 2007) and Jessica Stanton’s data on
Forms of Government and Rebel Group Violence against
Civilians in Civil Wars, 1989–2010 (Stanton 2016).

tack or consistently failed to discriminate between com-
batants and noncombatants in their military operations
throughout the course of a conflict.12 We first use a
binary indicator of whether any actor targeted civilians
during war, reflecting the general version of Hypothesis
1. Next, we use binary indicators capturing whether
each actor engaged in civilian targeting. The government
alone targeted civilians in about 50 percent of conflicts.
In about 12 percent, both governments and rebels de-
liberately targeted civilians. In the remaining 38 percent
of cases, neither side deliberately targeted civilians in a
consistent manner.

Hypotheses 2 and 3 anticipate that the extent to
which intra-war atrocities lead to postwar repression will
vary by perpetrator and government composition. To
test these hypotheses, we estimate the effect of target-
ing conditional on government composition: who was
in control at the end of the conflict, i.e., the incumbent
government (55 percent of the conflicts analyzed in the
dataset), a prior rebel group (19 percent of conflicts), a
power-sharing arrangement (21 percent of conflicts), or
an unclear assertion of authority (5 percent of conflicts),
including so-called failed states.

Control Variables

To address potential confounders, we include in our anal-
yses the two aforementioned variables that may predict
civilian targeting and are also expected to affect hu-
man rights conditions in post-conflict countries: demo-
cratic institutions before the conflict starts, measuring
prior constraints; and population size as a proxy for low-
information environments. Additionally, we expect HRP
to improve, even if slowly, the more time has passed af-
ter a conflict. We control for the expected trend by in-
cluding the count of years since the end of a conflict as a
predictor.

Several other variables serve as control variables
for repression after conflict. Studies have found democ-
racy to be consistently correlated with better human
rights practices within a state (Henderson 1991; Poe
and Tate 1994; Cingranelli and Richards 1999; Poe,
Tate, and Keith 1999; Davenport 2007) although there
are some studies that suggest human rights abuses are
more likely during transitions to democracy (Fein 1995;
Davenport 2007). We control for the contemporane-
ous effects of constraints on the executive in countries
with more democratic institutions by including a mea-
sure of executive constraints in the year after the con-
flict ended. This measure, from the Polity IV dataset,

12 Combatants are defined as individuals that engage in
armed resistance against regime forces.
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is an index that ranges from 1–7 and measures “the
extent of institutionalized constraints on the decision-
making power of chief executives” (Marshall and
Jaggers 2002, 23). Using only the executive constraints
measure, rather than the summary index, allows us to
avoid potential endogeneity. Scholars have noted that
several components of the democracy index implicitly
capture HRP (Hill and Jones 2014, 677). Although the
level of executive constraints in the year after conflict
termination cannot be a confounding variable since it
does not precede civilian targeting during the war, con-
trolling for it allows us to parse out the long-term ef-
fects of civilian victimization that are independent of for-
mal institutional constraints on the executive that exist at
conflict termination.

The intensity of a violent conflict is a potential con-
founding factor. While we expect a government or rebel
strategy of targeting civilians to increase human rights
violations in the post-conflict period, it is possible that
civilian targeting during a war and human rights viola-
tions following the war are both symptoms of a particu-
larly severe conflict. To minimize the influence of highly
intense conflicts and avoid bias from casualty reporting,
we use a binary indicator for conflicts where government
casualties exceeded 10,000 during the course of the entire
conflict.13 Government casualties exceeded this number
in approximately 10 percent of conflicts.14

We control for differences in levels of economic de-
velopment across time and across countries by includ-
ing the natural log of Gross Domestic Product (GDP)
per capita (in 1995 constant US dollars, from Gleditsch
2002) in each post-conflict year. Lastly, we include a bi-
nary variable to indicate that active armed conflict has
resumed in a country because we anticipate a decline in
HRP scores with conflict recurrence. Additional robust-
ness tests (on slightly smaller samples) control for an in-
crease or decrease in economic grievances as a result of
the conflict via the change in GDP per capita compared
to pre-conflict levels (based on Gleditsch 2002), as well as
a separate measure for conflict outcome (government or
rebel victory, or settlement; taken from the STAC data).

Results

In Table 2, two models test whether civilian targeting
by any actor (1) or government or rebel forces (2, 3,
and 4) has a direct, unconditional effect on changes in

13 The rebel casualty variable is missing a value in too
many cases to make it a useful control in our analyses.

14 Our results are robust to the use of a lower threshold for
high-intensity conflict.

HRP in post-conflict countries compared to HRP levels
in the decade before the conflict. In Table 3, we evaluate
whether this effect is conditional on who holds power
after the conflict ends.

Hypothesis 1: Domestic Security Dilemma

Hypothesis 1 predicts a legacy of violence effect, whereby
civilian targeting during an internal armed conflict has an
enduring impact on human rights conditions even after a
conflict ends. In Table 2,Model 1 shows that post-conflict
HRP drop significantly after a conflict when any actor
targeted civilians during the conflict. This drop in HRP
is at a magnitude of about one-third of a standard devi-
ation of that measure, a sizeable and statistically signifi-
cant change.Models 2, 3, and 4, show that this difference
is entirely due to cases where governments targeted civil-
ians. We see no difference in HRP if rebels alone, or both
government and rebel troops, targeted civilians. We con-
clude that government civilian targeting has a noticeable
impact on repression after conflict; rebel civilian target-
ing or joint targeting itself has no impact beyond poor
pre-war human rights conditions and the war itself. Uni-
lateral atrocities committed by governments during war
have an enduring effect on human rights,whereas civilian
targeting by both sides does not increase repression in ad-
dition to potentially high levels of pre-war repression. Im-
portantly, our analyses compare variation in the amount
and direction of within-case change in HRP across cases
rather than varying levels of HRP across cases. This ad-
dresses concerns about endogeneity; we do not simply
show that countries with poor HRP experienced civilian
targeting and thus showed poor HRP after conflicts. In-
stead, we find that some countries’ HRP record improved
while the record of others deteriorated, holding the base-
line HRP level constant. Government targeting of civil-
ians is a main driver of this decline in HRP. These results
are robust to changing the time windows in which the
pre-conflict average HRP score is measured (see the top
five rows in Figure 3), and to changing the length of the
time period after conflict included in the sample (bottom
five rows in Figure 3). The same results also obtain when
investigating only aggregate changes in HRP instead of
analyzing yearly changes (see Tables A2 and A3 in the
supplementary information).

Hypothesis 2: Path Dependence

While Hypothesis 1 suggests that brutal civil wars en-
gender post-conflict societies with poor human rights
conditions regardless of who controls the post-conflict
government, our next two hypotheses test whether the
effects of civilian victimization vary by perpetrator and
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Table 2. Multilevel regression estimates of changes in HRP, compared to the HRP average in the five years before conflict

(1) (2) (3) (4)

Any side targeted civilians −0.35*
(0.16)

Government targeted civilians −0.37* −0.29* −0.37*
(0.16) (0.16) (0.16)

Both government and rebels targeted civilians −0.28 −0.28 −0.29
(0.29) (0.28) (0.29)

>10k government casualties 0.31 0.31 0.36* 0.29
(0.22) (0.22) (0.21) (0.22)

Years after conflict 0.05* 0.05* 0.05* 0.05*
(0.01) (0.01) (0.01) (0.01)

HRP before conflict, five-year average −0.43* −0.42* −0.39* −0.43*
(0.10) (0.10) (0.09) (0.10)

Democracy before conflict −0.12 −0.12 −0.09 −0.13
(0.19) (0.19) (0.20) (0.19)

Population (logged) −0.08 −0.08 −0.07 −0.07
(0.06) (0.06) (0.07) (0.07)

Executive constraints 0.12* 0.12* 0.12* 0.12*
(0.03) (0.03) (0.03) (0.03)

Conflict resumed −0.25* −0.25* −0.24* −0.25*
(0.09) (0.09) (0.09) (0.09)

GDP per capita (logged) −0.01 −0.01 −0.09 −0.01
(0.08) (0.08) (0.10) (0.09)

Change in GDP per capita from pre-conflict period 0.21*
(0.13)

Conflict outcome: compromise 0.04
(0.23)

Conflict outcome: government victory −0.01
(0.21)

Constant −0.19 −0.21 0.29 −0.24
(0.66) (0.69) (0.77) (0.68)

Observations 688 688 685 686
Number of conflicts 96 96 94 95

Notes: Unit of analysis: post-conflict period year (up to year 10). Standard errors, clustered by country, in parentheses. *p < 0.05, one-tailed tests.

government composition. Table 3 reports results from
multilevel regressions that include interaction terms to
test for the conditional relationships predicted by these
two hypotheses. For ease of interpretation, we show in
Figure 4 the estimated differences in how a country’s
HRP score changes in different post-conflict government
control scenarios when the civil war government targeted
civilians compared to when it was restrained in its treat-
ment of civilians.

If Hypothesis 2 is true, we should observe a decline of
HRP when civil war governments that targeted civilians
remain in power. We find no evidence to support this hy-
pothesis. Generally, government civilian targeting during
conflicts is associated with drops in HRP after conflict,
but the only scenario in which government targeting of

civilians during war does not lead to a further significant
decrease in HRP is if the civil war government remains
in power after conflict termination. Here, we find some
decrease in HRP, but the data are too noisy to identify a
robust effect.

Hypothesis 3: Radicalization and Revenge

In contrast, there is considerable evidence for Hypothesis
3. When the opposition seizes power from a government
that victimized civilians during the war, post-conflict
HRP scores drop significantly below pre-conflict levels,
by about a half-standard deviation of the measure. HRP
scores drop even more in a state with unclear gover-
nance after the government targeted civilians and under
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Table 3.Multilevel regression estimates of changes in HRP,

compared to the HRP average in the five years before

conflict, conditional on government control after conflict

(1)

Government targeted civilians −0.41*
(0.25)

Government remains in power1 −0.04
(0.27)

Power sharing1 0.23
(0.32)

Unclear government control or failed state1 −0.15
(0.31)

Government targeted civilians and
government remains in power1

0.20

(0.33)
Government targeted civilians and power

sharing1
−0.27

(0.39)
Government targeted civilians and unclear

control/failed state1
−0.26

(0.30)
>10k government casualties 0.35

(0.22)
Years after conflict 0.05*

(0.01)
HRP before conflict, five-year average −0.41*

(0.09)
Democracy before conflict −0.10

(0.19)
Population (logged) −0.09

(0.07)
Executive constraints 0.12*

(0.03)
Conflict resumed −0.25*

(0.09)
GDP per capita (logged) −0.02

(0.09)
Constant 0.03

(0.78)
Observations 688
Post-conflict periods 96

Notes: Unit of analysis: post-conflict period year (up to year 10). Standard errors,

clustered by country, in parentheses. *p < 0.05, one-tailed tests.
1Baseline comparison: former opposition assumes power.

power-sharing arrangements after the government tar-
geted civilians. That is, if governments that targeted
civilians lose their sole grip on power—to their former
opponents, a power-sharing arrangement, or to a power
vacuum—repression increases. The path from brutal
civil war to poor post-conflict outcomes is strongest
when the government does not remain in power. This
is consistent with arguments about radicalization and
revenge in the wake of government-led targeting during
armed conflicts. Civilian targeting during war has an
enduring effect on human rights conditions.

Discussion

Our results uncover evidence for a lasting legacy of gov-
ernment brutality against civilians during internal armed
conflicts. This evidence goes beyond patterns of civilian
targeting in states that already repress their population.
Instead, we find that HRP decline substantially after civil
wars involving civilian targeting by governments, even
when governments already had a tainted human rights
record before conflicts began.

One theoretical argument led us to anticipate that
HRPwould be especially likely to deteriorate in countries
where abusive governments remain in power, possibly ex-
ploiting the opportunity to purge and repress former en-
emies (Hypothesis 2). We do not find evidence for this
pattern. HRP do not decline much further if an abusive
government stays in power. Instead, we find evidence for
possible patterns of radicalization and revenge. Human
rights conditions declined substantially after a previously
abusive government lost its sole grip on power, either to a
government led by former rebels, a power-sharing agree-
ment, or unclear governance structures. We take this as
indication that civilian targeting by governments shifts
norms even beyond human rights violations in peacetime.

Many studies show the lasting and considerable neg-
ative impact of civil war on a range of political, social,
and economic outcomes in post-war societies. Our study
emphasizes important sources of variation in these ef-
fects, conditional on the treatment of civilians during the
conflict. The conduct of belligerents in civil wars shapes
human security after war termination in profound and
sometimes counterintuitive ways.

Conclusion

In many countries, internal armed conflicts are associated
with often dramatic changes inHRP compared to the pre-
conflict period (see Figure 1). This study offers one ex-
planation for this variation. We show that governments’
treatment of civilians during conflicts can leave a last-
ing legacy for HRP. Where governments specifically tar-
get civilians as part of their counterinsurgency campaign,
human rights conditions decline even further after wars
end. This is not an artifact of brutal governments abusing
civilian populations before, during, and after conflicts. In-
stead, the damaging legacy of armed conflict for human
rights is particularly acute when abusive governments
are replaced by the former opposition or enter power-
sharing agreements. This finding is consistent with a dy-
namic of radicalization and revenge on the side of the for-
mer opposition.While the lack of more fine-grained data
on the identity of human rights violators after conflict
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Figure 3. Overview of robustness tests – estimates for the coefficient on “government targeted civilians” across varying time

windows

Source: Estimates in Tables A4 and A5 in the supporting information.

Figure 4. Predicted changes in HRP scores in different scenarios.

Source: Estimates from Model (1) in Table 3.

precludes us from asserting more specifically who abuses
human rights in our sample of cases, these findings have
clear implications for understanding human rights abuses
and for international policymakers and human rights
advocates.

For research on human rights, our findings suggest
that specific norms violations during war (in this case, tar-
geting civilians) have long-lasting ramifications that tran-
scend political parties or groups holding power.While all
armed conflict has deleterious consequences for a host
of social, political, and economic outcomes, armed con-
flicts in which governments actively target their own
population lead to a substantive drop in HRP. Future
research should investigate the channels of how such
norms violations translate into abusive behavior by sub-
sequent governments. Although we interpret our find-
ings as evidence for “radicalization and revenge” on
the side of the former opposition, it would be impor-
tant to learn whether subsequent human rights vio-
lations are motivated by a general erosion of norms

(radicalization) or a desire for revenge for government
atrocities.

For policymakers and human rights advocates, this
study highlights once more that governments targeting
civilians during internal armed conflicts open Pandora’s
box of future human rights abuses. This finding does not
bode well for recent conflicts such as the civil war in
Syria, regardless of how the conflict ends. Even if the As-
sad government had agreed to partially relinquish power,
the damage for human rights norms in Syria was already
done. In this sense, our findings yield yet another impetus
for the international community to provide stronger de-
terrents for governments considering targeting civilians
as part of their counterinsurgency strategy. While this
study does not aim to explain why governments do or
do not target civilians in the first place, it suggests that
international efforts to prevent such behavior should be
motivated not only by a desire to prevent atrocities in
the present, but also with an eye toward reducing abuse
in the future.
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Supplementary Information

Supplementary information is available at the Journal of
Global Security Studieswebsite.The data and code neces-
sary to reproduce the analyses in this article are available
at https://dataverse.harvard.edu/dataverse/jkarreth.
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